BIDS RECEIVED FOR BOLTS, NUTS AND WASHERS

02/22/11

BARNES DISTRIBUTION

ELKAY FASTENING

FASTENAL COMPANY

WINTER EQUIP.

USED COST PER COST PER COST PER COST PER
PAST YEAR AMOUNT | HUNDRED TOTAL HUNDRED TOTAL HUNDRED TOTAL HUNDRED TOTAL
174" x 1" 500 5 6.25 31.25 9.45 47.25 9.73 48.65 | NO BID
1/4" nuts 600 6 4.48 26.88 5.84 35.04 5.53 33.18 | NO BID
1/4" washers 1100 11 2.09 22.99 4.14 45 .54 2.94 32.34 | NO BID
5/16" x 1 1/2" 300 3 11.77 35.31 19.44 58.32 16.23 48.69 | NO BID
5/16" nuts 700 7 5.42 37.94 9.20 64.40 8.66 60.62 | NO BID
5/16" washers 1700 17 3.62 61.54 5.70 96.90 3.52 59.84 | NO BID
5/16" locknuts 600 6 8.34 50.04 11.60 69.60 15.11 90.66 | NO BID
3/8" x 1 1/2" 500 5 16.18 80.90 23.18 115.90 22.98 114.90 | NO BID
3/8" nuts 900 9 7.44 66.96 13.60 122 .40 13.13 118.17 | NO BID
3/8" washers 2200 22 4_.00 88.00 6.36 139.92 4.03 88.66 | NO BID
3/8" locknuts 400 4 10.14 40.56 13.68 54.72 11.75 47.00 | NO BID
1/2" x 1 1/2" 200 2 30.19 60.38 49.76 99.52 44.78 89.56 | NO BID
1/2" nuts 600 6 15.93 95.58 25.52 153.12 24._.29 145.74 | NO BID
1/2" washers 600 6 10.96 65.76 14.70 88.20 8.81 52.86 | NO BID
1/2" locknuts 200 2 21.16 42 .32 25.68 51.36 19.45 38.90 | NO BID
5/8" x 2" 100 1 62.04 62.04 73.14 73.14 81.62 81.62 | NO BID
5/8" nuts 900 9 26.29 236.61 47.68 429.12 47.52 427.68 | NO BID
5/8" washers 400 4 19.50 78.00 21.96 87.84 37.79 151.16 | NO BID
5/8" locknuts 600 6 39.67 238.02 48.96 293.76 41.21 247.26 | NO BID
3/4" x 2 1/2" 100 1 111.26 111.26 167.88 167.88 140.00 140.00 | NO BID
3/4" nuts 400 4 40.90 163.60 78.96 315.84 78.00 312.00 | NO BID
3/4" washers 300 3 25.70 77.10 33.18 99.54 20.67 62.01 | NO BID
5/16" x 3 1/2" 7500 75 10.77 807.75 8.48 636.00 8.14 610.50 | NO BID
5/16" nuts 7500 75 2.62 196.50 1.62 121.50 1.19 89.25 | NO BID
5/16" washers 7500 75 1.39 104 .25 1.36 102.00 2.37 177.75 | NO BID
174" x 1 3/4" 2500 25 9.37 234.25 4.68 117.00 5.02 125.50 | NO BID
1/4" washers 1000 10 1.22 12.20 2.82 28.20 1.18 11.80 4.31 52.58
174" locknuts 2500 25 4.91 122.75 2.20 55.00 4_05 101.25 3.04 76.00
5/8" x 2 GR8 1200 12 74.12 889.44 22 .66 271.92 35.60 427 .20 49.41 592.92
5/8" x 2 1/2" 1000 10 84.75 847.50 59.97 599.70 42 .51 425.10 60.46 604.60
5/8" nuts 1100 11 69.29 762.19 11.93 131.23 16.03 176.33 16.76 184._.36
5/8" washers 2000 20 8.69 173.80 5.20 104.00 9.61 192.20 5.32 106.40
5/8" x 3" 400 4 124 .77 499.08 61.20 244 .80 68.62 274 .48 71.53 286.12
3/4" x 2 1/2" 200 2 126.55 253.10 86.85 173.70 86.94 173.88 | NO BID
3/4" x 3 200 2 130.90 261.80 92.50 185.00 98.47 196.94 | 108.07 216.14
6,937.65 5,479.36 5,473.68 2,119.12

grade 8 cost




