BIDS RECEIVED FOR GRADER BLADES

02722711

ST. REGIS | HEIGHTS MACH. | WINTER EQUIP. VALK TRUCK & TRAILER

374" x 6" X 6" 52.36 57.31 64 .88 53.30 47 .93

5/8" x 6" X 6" 37.24 47.71 53.82 41 .87 39.13

5/8" x 8" x 6° 61.00 67.29 75.37 59.75 53.63
Curved Carbide

374" x 6" x 4° 383.24 419.87 472 .53 No Bid 221.13
Carbide Embedded

7/8" x 5" x 4* 260.00 300.00 334.4200 No Bid 215.23
Carbide Matrix

7/8" x 5" x 4° No Bid No Bid 262.00 No Bid 219.93

curved 1x6x48




