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VESCO VESCO Corrigan Oil Cert. Lab |Karbowski
15W-40 gal 6.99 7.29 6.87 18.39 6.87
Trans/Hyd gal 5.99 6.79 5.18 16.61 6.31
TO 4/730 W gal 6.69 8.19 7.34 17.12 6.97
TO 4/10 W gal 6.49 8.19 6.90 17.12 6.70
85 W 140 gal 10.10 10.10 7.48 20.16 8.97
Dexron 111
quart 3.33 3.33 2.18 No Bid 2.19
55 gallon drum gal 5.99 5.99 5.56 17.04 6.49
Dexron VI
quart 4_25 4_25 4_81 No Bid 3.48
55 gallon drum gal 10.50 10.50 9.22 No Bid 12.67
Allison TES295
5 gallon pail 213.60 213.60 135.44 49.63/9gl 139.99
55 gallon drum drum 1347.50 1347 .50 1386.61 46.22/9l 1401.95
Drum Deposit 25.00 25.00 20.00 0.00 0.00
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ROWLEYS ROWLEYS
15W-40 gal 6.95 6.98
Trans/Hyd gal 6.74 5.76
TO 4/30 W gal 7.27 7.27
TO 4/10 W gal 7.27 7.27
85 W 140 gal 11.56 8.73
Dexron 111
quart 1.76 1.76
55 gallon drum gal 6.19 6.19
Dexron VI
quart 3.19 3.19
55 gallon drum gal 10.02 10.02
Allison TES295
5 gallon pail No Bid No Bid
55 gallon drum drum 684 .06 684 .06
Drum Deposit 20.00 20.00




